ORDINANCE NO. _108

AN ORDINANCE REPEALING ORDINANCESNUMBER 102 & 107, THE PRESENT BUILDING
CODE OF THE DISTRICT, AND ENACTING IN LIEU THEREOF A NEW ORDINANCE
GOVERNING THE DESIGN, CONSTRUCTION, ALTERATION, ENLARGEMENT, EQUIPMENT
REPAIR, DEMOLITION, REMOVAL, CONVERSION, USE OR MAINTENANCE OF ALL
BUILDINGS AND STRUCTURES; AND FURTHER PROVIDING FOR THE ISSUE IN SAID
PERMITS, COLLECTION OF FEES, MAKING OF INSPECTIONS, AND PROVIDING PENALTIES
FOR THE VIOLATION THEREOF.

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS OF THE MEHLVILLE FIRE
PROTECTION DISTRICT OF ST. LOUIS COUNTY, MISSOURI AS FOLLOWS:

SECTION 1. INCONSISTENT ORDINANCES REPEALED.

Ordinance number 102 & 107 of the Mehlville Fire Protection Didtrict of . Louis County, Missouri,
and al other Ordinances or parts of Ordinances in conflict herewith are hereby repedled.

SECTION 2. ADOPTION OF BUILDING CODE.

That a certain document, three (3) copies of which are on file in the office of the Code Officid of the
Mehlville Fire Protection District of St. Louis County, Missouri, being marked and designated as “ 1CC°,
International Building Code, 2003 edition” as published by the International Code Council, Inc., together
with the standards which are referenced in Chapter 35 (pp. 579 — 596) be and is hereby adopted as the
Building Code of the Mehlville Fire Protection Didtrict of St. Louis County, Missouri, for the control of
buildings and structures as herein provided; and each and al of the regulations, provisions, pendties, conditions,
and terms of the “ 1CC®, International Building Code, 2003 edition” , are hereby referred to, adopted and
made a part hereof, as if more fully set out in this Ordinance, with the additions, insertions, deletions and
changes prescribed in Section 4 of this Ordinance.

SECTION 3. JURISDICTIONAL TITLES.

100.1 Wherever (nameof jurisdiction) appearsin such Code, it shal read the Mehlville Fire Protection
Didtrict of &. Louis County, Missouri.

100.2 "Code Officid" wherever it may appear is defined as the Fire Marshd and/or Chief Fire

Inspector of the Mehlville Fire Protection Didtrict of St. Louis County, Missouri, or his duly authorized
representative.

Page 1 of 24



SECTION 4. AMENDMENTSTO THE INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE, 2003 EDITION.

CHAPTER 1
SECTION 101.2 Exception #2(page 1) delete inits entirety. Insert:

Exceptions:
2. Exiding buildingsundergoing repair, dterationsor additionsand change of occupancy shal
comply with either Chapters 1 through 33 or Chapter 34 of this code.

SECTION 102.5 (page 1) add a new section. Insert:

102.5Mattersnot provided for: Any requirementsthat are essentid for the structurd, fire or sanitary
safety of an existing or proposed building or structure, or for the safety of the occupantsthereof, which
are not specificaly provided for by this code, shdl be determined by the code officid.

SECTION 104.12 (page 3) add a new Section. Insert:

104.12 Rule-making authority: The code officid shall have authority as necessary inthe interest of
public hedlth, safety and generd welfare, to adopt and promulgate rulesand regulationsto interpret and
implement the provisons of this code to secure the intent thereof and to designate requirements
applicable because of locd climatic or other conditions. Such rules shall not have the effect of waiving
gructurd or fire performance requirements specificaly provided for in this code or of violaing
accepted engineering practice involving public sefety.

Page 2 of 24



SECTION 105.2 (page 3) delete in its entirety, Insert:

105.2 Work exempt from permit: Exemptions from permit requirements of this code shdl not be
deemed to grant authority for any work to be done in any manner in violation of the provisons of this
code or any other laws or ordinances of thisjurisdiction. Permitsshal not be required for thefallowing:

Building

1. One-story detached accessory structures used as tool and storage sheds,
playhouses and similar uses provided the floor area does not exceed 120 square
feet.

Temporary motion picture, televison and theater stage sets and scenery.

3. Window awnings supported by an exterior wal which do not project more than
54 inches from the exterior wall and do not require additional support of Group
R-3, asapplicable in Section 101.2 , and Group U occupancies.

4. Movable cases, counters and partitions not over 5 feet 9 inchesin height.

N

Gas
1. Portable heating appliance.
Replacement of any minor part that does not dter gpprova of equipment or make
such equipment unsafe.
M echanical
Portable heating appliance.
Portable ventilation equipment.
Portable cooling unit.
Steam, hot or chilled water piping within any heating or cooling equipment
regulated by this code.
Replacement of any part which does not dter its gpprova or make it unsafe.
Portable evaporative cooler.
7. Sdf-contained refrigeration system containing 10 poundsor less of refrigerant and
actuated by motors of 1 horsepower or less.

N

> owbdhpE

o U

SECTION 106.1 (page 5) delete in its entirety. Insert:

106.1 Submittal documents: The construction documentsfor new construction, dteration, repairs,
expangon, addition or modification for buildings or sructuresshdl be prepared by aregistered design
professond. All construction documents shal be prepared by the appropriate registered design
professond conggent with the professond regidration laws of the State of Missouri. The
construction documents shall include the name and address of the registered design professional and
shall be signed, sedled and dated by the registered design professiond in accordance with Section
106.1.1.

Exception:

1. Thenatureof thework gpplied for issuch that review of congtruction documentsis not
necessary to obtain compliance with this code.

Page 3 of 24



SECTION 106.1.1 (page 5) add anew section. Insert:

106.1.1 Application of seals: When congtruction documents are submitted, the goplication of seds
and sgnatures on those documents shall be required as follows:

a. All congtruction documents submitted with an gpplication for abuilding permit shall bear
an origina embossed or wet ink sed and origind sSgnature on the front sheet of each
discipline within each set of congtruction documents; or

b. The regigtered design professond for each discipline shal place his origina sed and
signature upon the cover sheet of each set of construction documents.

All other sheets of the congtruction documents, other than specificationsor caculations, shall
bear the origina embossed, wet ink or mechanicaly reproduced sedl of the registered design
professona. Any addenda or modifications submitted for changes to the construction

documentsshal aso bear an origind seal and signature by rheregistered design professiond.
Such changes shall be clearly indicated.

SECTION 108.2 (page 6) deletein its entirety. Insert:
108.2 Schedule of per mit fees: The permit fee for al work donein the Mehlville Fire Protection

Didtrict shdl be as shown in Table 108.2. The base amount shown isthe plan review fee and isnot
subject to refundsin accordance with Section 108.6.

Page 4 of 24



TABLE 108.2 (page 6) add a new Table. Insert:

Permit Type Permit Fee
0001 | New Residence $50 + $1.50/1000
0002 | Residentia Addition $50 + $1.50/1000
0003 | Detached Res. Garage $50 + $1.50/1000
0004 | Fire Damage Repair $50 + $1.50/1000
0005 | Fireplace $50 + $1.50/1000
0006 | Wood Stove $50 + $1.50/1000
0007 | Residentid Remodd $50 + $1.50/1000
0010 | Condo Building $100 + $3/1000
0011 | Condo Shell $100 + $3/1000
0012 | Condo Interior Finish $100 + $3/1000
0014 | Condo Fire Damage Repair $100 + $3/1000
0015 | Condo Miscellaneous $100 + $3/1000
0020 | Apartment Building $100 + $3/1000
0021 | Apatment Shell $100 + $3/1000
0022 | Apartment Interior Finish $100 + $3/1000
0024 | Apartment Fire Damage $100 + $3/1000
0025 | Apartment Miscellaneous $100 + $3/1000
0030 | Commercid Building $100 + $3/1000
0031 | Commercid Shell $100 + $3/1000
0032 | Commercid Interior Finish $100 + $3/1000
0034 | Commercid Fire Damage $100 + $3/1000
0035 | Commercid Addition $100 + $3/1000
0036 | Commercid Remodel $100 + $3/1000
0037 | Sprinkler System $100 + $3/1000
0038 | UG FireMain $100 + $3/1000
0039 | Fire Alarm System $100 + $3/1000
0040 | Range Hood Suppression System $100 + $3/1000
0041 | Underground Fuel Tank(s) $100 + $3/1000
0042 | LP Tank(9) $100 + $3/1000
0043 | Remove UG Fued Tank(s) $100 + $3/1000
0044 | Repair UG Fuel Ling(s) $100 + $3/1000
0045 | Above-ground Fud Tank $100 + $3/1000
0046 | UG Fud Line Modification $100 + $3/1000
0047 | Fire Suppression System $100 + $3/1000
0050 | Miscdlaneous $100 + $3/1000
0051 | Miscdlaneous - Residentid $50 + $1.50/1000

Page 5 of 24




0060 | Flood Damage Repair $0
0098 | Void - Resdentid $50
0099 | Void - Other $100
240 | Fireworks $150
300 | Reoccupancy $100
310 | Mdl Function $100
320 | Specid Use Permit $100
330 | Resdentid TOP $50
335 | Residentia TOP extension $25/month
340 | Commercid TOP $100
345 | Commercid TOP extension $50/month
Sart of construction without permit Up to $500
Reingpection fee $50
Burn Permit - Air Curtain $100
New Site Plan Review $100
Vaiancefiling fee $100
Demolition permit $25 + $0.10 per 100 sq. ft.

Page 6 of 24




SECTION 109.3.1 (page 7) delete in its entirety. Insert:

109.3.1 Inspectionsrequired and ingpection placard: Whenwork has progressed to apoint of
having windows, or when the job is an dteration or addition, the placard shall be attached to the
available glass in view for recording the baance of ingpections required by the Building Code.
(Falure to maintain this ingpection and identification board will not relieve the permittee of
responsibility as provided by the Building Code) Upon satisfactory completion of the building
gructure, the Code Officia or his authorized representative will make hisfinal inspection, and if all
requirements of the Building Code are met, including compliance with themechanica, and eectrical
codes of Mehlville Fire Protection Didtrict, he will remove the job ingpection card.

SECTION 109.3.2 (page 7) delete in its entirety. Insert:

109.3.2 Inspection sequence and approval: No work shall be done on any part of thebuilding
or structure beyond the point indicated in each successiveingpection without first obtaining the written
approva of the Code Officid or his authorized representative. Written approva shdl be given only
after an ingpection has been made of each successive step in the congtruction and al code
requirements or corrections are completed as indicated by each of the inspectionsrequired. There
shdl be a find ingpection and gpprova of dl buildings to be completed before occupancy as
described in Section 110 of the Building Code. Failureto obtain afina ingpection before occupancy
will condtitute aviolation of the Building Code, subject to the pendties as described in Section 113.4.
Structura framework of any part of abuilding or structure shall not be covered or concedled in any
manner without first obtaining the approva of the Code Officid. The Code Officid, upon notification
from the permit holder or his agent, in accordance with rules of procedure posted in the office of the
Code Officid, and described on the permit placard, shal make the following inspections and shall

ether gpprove that section or portion of the construction as completed, or shall notify the permit
holder or his agent that he has faled to comply with the law. Minimum number of ingpections
required are as contained in Sections 109.3.2.1 and 109.3.2.2.

SECTION 109.3.2.1 (page 7) add anew Section. Insert:

109.3.2.1 Framing or rough-in ingpection: A framing or rough-iningpection shall bemade&fter dl
framing, masonry walls, or fireplace vents and chimneys are completed, including the roof structure,
fire blocking, wall bracing, sheathing, heating and cooling duct work, or other gppurtenances and
accessories which may be concedled, and after plumbing, eectrica, and fire rough-in inspections
have been posted by those ingpection departments. No mechanica, eectrica or plumbing systems
which are to be concedled shdl be covered before thisingpection has been made and approved by
the Code Officidl.

SECTION 109.3.2.2 (page 7) add anew Section. Insert:

109.3.2.2 Supplemental inspections: In addition to the required ingpections hereinbefore specified,
the Code Officid may make other ingpectionswhich in hisjudgment are reasonably necessary dueto
unusua congtruction or circumgtances. The Code Officid shdl have the authority to inspect any
congruction work to verify compliance with the Building Code and to properly enforce the rules
promulgated by this Code.

Page 7 of 24



SECTION 109.3.3 (page 7) delete in its entirety.
SECTION 109.3.4 (page 7) deleteinits entirety.
SECTION 109.3.5 (page 7) deleteinits entirety.
SECTION 109.3.7 (page 7) deletein its entirety.
SECTION 110.4 (page 8) delete in its entirety. Insert:

110.4 Revocation: The cetificate of Use and Occupancy shall dways be subject to this Code.
Non-compliance with theregulations of this Code shal be deemed aviol ation subject to the pendties
st forth herein, and in addition the Code Officid shall be empowered to revoke the occupancy
permit, or permits, issued for the building in question, until such time as the violations are corrected.
All cogs involved in this procedure shal be addressed againgt the owner. The issuance of any
occupancy permit shdl not rieve the owner or tenant from compliance with dl regulations of this
Code and other applicable regulations.

SECTION 110.5 (page 8) add anew Section. Insert:

110.5 Certificaterequired: Failureof the owner or tenant of abuilding to obtain the certificate of
occupancy and to pay the fees set forth shal be deemed aviolation and shall subject said owner or
tenant to the penalties prescribed in Section 113.4.

SECTION 110.5.1 (page 8) add anew Section. Insert:
110.5.1 Feerequired: The feefor a Certificate of Occupancy shal be as stated in Table 108.2.
SECTION 112.1 through 112.3 (page 8) delete inits entirety. Insert:

112.1 Appeals. Anowner, lessee, agent, operator or occupant aggrieved by an order pursuant to

this order, may file an appeal to the Board of Directorswithin ten (10) daysfrom the service of any

order, and the Board of Directors shal fix atime and place not lessthan five (5) days or more than

ten (10) days thereafter when and where such an appeal may be heard by it. Such apped shall stay

the execution of such order until it has been heard and reviewed, vacated or confirmed by the Board.
In computing the number of days, Saturdays, Sundays and legd holidays shdl be excluded.

The Board of Directors shdl, a such hearings, affirm, modify, revoke or vacate such order. In
conducting and holding the hearing, the Board of Directors shdl follow the procedures set forth in
8536 RSMo. for "contested" matters. Unlessrevoked or vacated, such order shal then be complied
with.

Nothing herein contained shdl be deemed to deny the right of any person, firm, corporation, co-
partnership or voluntary association to apped from an order of adecision of the Board of Directors
to a court of competent jurisdiction. Appedls from find decisons of the Board shdl be to the
appropriate Circuit Court, pursuant to the provisons of 8536.100 RSMo. Such appeals shall stay
the execution of such order until it has been heard and reviewed, vacated or confirmed by the Court.

Page 8 of 24



SECTION 1134 (page 8) delete in its entirety. Insert:

113.4 Violation, penalties. Any person, firm or corporation who shal violate any provison of this
Ordinance, or who shall fail to comply with any of the requirements thereof, or who shdl erect,

congtruct, dter or repair astructurein violation of an gpproved plan or directive of the Code Officid,
or of apermit or certificate issued under the provisons of this Ordinance, or shal start any work
requiring apermit without first obtaining apermit therefor, or who shdl continue any workin or about
adiructure after having been served astop-work order, except for such work which that person, firm
or corporation has been directed to perform to remove aviol ation or unsafe condition, or any owner
or tenant of a building, or premises or any other person who commits, takes part or assstsin any

violation of this Code or who maintains any building or premises in which such may cause to be
indtituted in the name of the Didtrict, acivil action for injunction or other appropriaterdief to securea
compliancewith the provisonsof thisCode. Injunctiveor other appropriate relief shal not bedenied
on the grounds that an adequate remedy &t law exigts through the impogtion of crimina sanctions.

SECTION 113.5 (page 8) add a new section. Insert:
113.5 Unlawful continuance: Any person who shdl continue any work in or about the Structure
after having been served with a stop work order, except such work as that person is directed to
perform to remove aviolaion or unsafe conditions, shal beligbleto pendtiesas specified in Section
113.4 of this Ordinance.
Section 113.6 (page 8) add a new section. Insert:
113.6 Civil action: Notwithstanding the provisions hereof, the Code Officid, with the approva of the Board
of Directors, may cause to be indituted in the name of the Didrict, a civil action for injunction or other
appropriate relief to secure a compliance with the provisons of this Code. Injunctive or other appropriate
relief shall not be denied on the grounds that an adequate remedy at law exigts through the imposition of
crimind sanctions.
SECTION 115.0 (page 9) delete in its entirety.

CHAPTER 2
SECTION 202.0 (pages 11 — 21) Insert:
All words and phrases and their definitions as sat out in Article 2 of the “ ICC, International
Building Code,2003 Edition” , are hereby adopted by reference asthough fully set out hereinwith
the following exceptions.
Family day care home; add anew definition as follows:
Family day care home: A family home occupied as a permanent resdence by the day care

provider, inwhich family-like careis given for morethan four (4) children, but not morethan ten (10)
children, not related to the day care provider, for any part of the twenty-four (24) hour day.

Page 9 of 24



CHAPTER 3
SECTION 308.3 (page 35). Deletein its entirety. Insert:

308.3 I-2. This occupancy shdl include buildings and structures used for medica, surgicd,
psychiatric, nursing or custodial care on a 24-hour basis of more than five persons who are not
capable of saf-preservation. This group shdl indude, but not be limited to, the following:

Hogpitals

Nursing homes (both intermediate- care facilities and skilled nuraing facilities)

Menta hospitas

Detoxification fadilities

A facility such asthe above with five or fewer persons shdl be classified as Group R-3 or shdll
comply with the International Residential Code in accordance with Section 101.2. A family day
care home shall be classfied as aresdentia use group.

SECTION 308.3.1 (page 35). Ddeteinitsentirety. Insert:
308.3.1 Child carefacility: A child carefacility which accommodates more than ten children 2 ¥
years|[ original bill read 22 years] of age or lessfor any length of time shdl be classified asUse
Group I-2.

CHAPTER 4
SECTION 402.7.2 (page 40) delete in its entirety. Insert:
402.7.2 Tenant separ ations: Each tenant space shall be separated from other tenant spacesby a
fire barrier having afireresstancerating of not lessthan 1 hour. Thefire barrier shal extend from
thetop of thefireresistance rated floor/ceiling bel ow to the underside of thefloor or roof dab or deck
above and shdl be securely attached thereto. Thesewals shdl be continuous through al concealed
gpaces such as the space above a suspended ceiling. A wall is not required between any tenant
gpace and amall, except for occupancy separations required elsawhere in this code.

CHAPTER 5
SECTION 501.2 (page 73) deletein its entirety. Insert:
Section 501.2 Street Numbers

501.2.1 General: Thefollowingwordsand termsshdl, for the purposes of this chapter and asstated
elsawhere in this code, have the meanings shown herein.

Street address number sign: A sign which designates the street number assigned to a particular
house, building or structure,

Reoccupancy: Any changein ownership, occupancy or useof the structure which would necessitate
the issuance of a new certificate of occupancy under any other provision of this code.

Page 10 of 24



501.2.2 Street address number signs. Each structure required to have astreet address number
sign displayed by Section 501.2.4, shall have the number so displayed in aposition easily observed
and readable from the public right-of-way. All numbers shdl bein Arabic figures at least four (4)
inches high and one-hdf (%% ) [ original bill read 2] inchwide strokes. All such numbersshdl bea
contrasting color to the background to which they are mounted.

501.2.3 Street address number signs- remote exit: In addition to the street address number
sign required by Section 501.2.2, additiond street address number signsshdl be provided at all
remote exit doors in occupancies of al Use Groups.

Exception: Detached structures of Use Group R-3.

501.2.4 Installation required: A street address number sign conforming to Section 501.2.2 or
501.2.3 shdl beingaled in the locations indicated in Sections 501.2.4.1 through 501.2.4.4

501.2.4.1 New Congtruction: Street address number signsshdl beingdled ondl new structures
of dl Use Groups. Street address number signs shdl be inddled prior to the find ingpection and
issuance of the certificate of occupancy.

501.2.4.2 Remodel or renovations: Street address number signs shdl beingaled on exiding
gructures of al Use Groups a any time the structure is increased in height or area or when any
adteration, modification or remodeling costing more than One Thousand Dollars ($ 1,000.00) ismade
to such existing structure.

501.2.4.3 Existing structur es: Street address number signs shdl beingdled on exigting dructures
of dl Use Groups within fifteen (15) days of written natification by the Code Officid. Natification
shdl be accomplished ether persondly or by United States Mail certified or registered mail with the
return receipt requested to the real property owner and/or occupant, or their agent, or by posting
such notice upon the premises,

Exception: Buildings of Use Group R-3.

501.2.4.4 Reoccupancy: Street address number signsshdl beingdled ondl exiding sructuresof
al Use Groups upon reoccupancy of any such existing structure and after proper natification to the
Mehlville Fire Protection Didtrict of . Louis County, Missouri.

Exception: Buildings of Use Groups R-2 and R-3.

Section 507.2 (pages 76 — 77) add a new Exception #3. Insert:

3. Group A-1, A-2 or A-3 occupancies are permitted provided the assembly occupancy is
separated from other spaces as required for separated uses in Section 302.3.2 and the
aggregate area of the assembly occupancies does not exceed 10 percent of the area of the
building nor the tabular vadues in Table 503 for the dlowable area of the assembly
occupancies.

Page 11 of 24



CHAPTER 9
SECTION 903.3.7.2 (page 169) add a new Section. Insert:

903.3.7.2 No parking ar easat fir e department connections. When fire department connections
are located in an areawhere vehicles may be parked or standing, said parking or standing shl be
restricted for ten (10) feet in each direction from the fire department connection.

SECTION 903.4.1 (page 170) delete inits entirety. Insert:

903.4.1 Signals. Alarm, supervisory and trouble signds shal be digtinctly different and
automatically transmitted to an gpproved central station as defined in NFPA 72.
Exceptions:
1. Underground key or hub vavesin roadway boxes provided by the municipdity or
public utility are not required to be monitored.
2. Backflow prevention device tet valves, located in limited area prinkler system supply
piping, shall be locked in the open position. In occupancies required to be equipped with
afiredarm system, the backflow preventer valves shdl be dectricaly supervised by a
tamper switch ingaled in accordance with NFPA 72 and separately annunciated.

SECTION 903.5.3 (page 170) add a new Section. Insert:

903.5.3 Water flow tests: Water flow tests for automatic sprinkler systems shal be conducted
between the hours of 8:00 am. and 4:30 p.m., Monday through Friday. Testsshdl bewithin thelast
twelve (12) months.

SECTION 903.5.3.1 (page 170) add a new Section. Insert:

903.5.3.1 Water flow safety factor: A safety factor shal beappliedto dl flow testsforautomatic
sprinkler systems. A pardld curve shal be drawn to the actua flow test curve that has been
reduced by 20% of the gtatic pressure. Anautomatic sprinkler systemdesign shdl not exceed the
20% curve.

SECTION 903.6 (page 170) add a new Section. Insert:

903.6 Post indicator valves: All automatic sprinkler systems, except limited area sprinkler
systems, shdl be provided with a post indicator vave that shal control the water supply to dl
automatic sprinkler systems in that building.

SECTION 904.11.7 (page 72) add anew Section. Insert:

904.11.7 Safety requirements. Where persons will be exposed to an dternative automatic fire-
extinguishing system discharge, warning signs and discharge darms shdl be provided.

Page 12 of 24



Section 904.11.8 (page 72) add a new section. Insert:

904.11.8 Acceptance tests. All dterndive autométic fire-extinguishing sysems shdl betested in
accordance with this section. A completed system shdl be tested by a discharge of expellant gas
through the piping and nozzles. Obsearvations for gas leakage and for continuity of piping with free
unobstructed flow shal be made. Observations shal be made of theflow of expellant gasthrough dll
nozzles. Theidentification of deviceswith proper designations and ingtructions shall bechecked. Al
dry-chemica and wet-chemicd extinguishing systems shdl dso be tested by a discharge of the
extinguishing agent. Discharge quantities shal be in accordance with the manufacturer’ singalation
information. After tegting, dl piping and nozzles shdl be blown clean usng compressed air or
nitrogen, and the system shdl be properly charged and placed in the normal “set” condition.

SECTION 907.14 (page 180) delete in its entirety. Insert:

907.14 Monitoring: All fireaarm and detection sysems shal be monitored by an gpproved centra
dtation as defined in NFPA 72.
Exception: Supervisory serviceis not required for:
1. Sngle- and multiple-station smoke aarms required by Section 907.2.10.
2. Smoke detectors in Group I-3 occupancies.
3. Automatic sprinkler sysemsin one- and two-family dwellings.

Page 13 of 24



TABLE 910.3 (page 190) deletein its entirety. Insert:

TABLE 910.3
REQUIREMENTS FOR CURTAIN BOARDS AND SMOKE VENTING?
MAXIMUM
MAXIMUM AREA DISTANCE TO
DESIGNATED FORMED BY VENT AREA TO MAXIMUM SPACING VENTS FROM
COMMODITY STORAGE HEIGHT | MINIMUM CURTAIN [ CURTAIN BOARDS FLOOR AREA OF VENT CENTERS | WALL OR CURTAIN
CLASSIFICATION (feet) DEPTH (feet) (square feet) RATIO (feet) BOARDS® (feet)
Group F-1 and 0.2xH 50,000 1:100 120 60
S-1 but=4 '
Y =20 6 10,000 1:100 100 60
(Option 1)
>20 <40 6 8,000 1:75 100 55
LV =20 4 3,000 1:75 100 55
(Option 2)
>20 <40 4 3,000 1:50 100 50
) =20 6 6,000 1:50 100 50
High hazard
(Option 1)
>20 <30 6 6,000 1:40 90 45
=20 4 4,000 1:50 100 50
High hazard
(Option 2)
>20 <30 4 2,000 1:30 75 40

For SlI: 1 foot = 304.8 mm, 1 square foot = 0.0929 m?
a. Reguirementsfor rack storage heightsin excess of thoseindicated shal bein accordancewith Chapter 23
of thelnternational Fire Code. For solid- piled storage helghtsin excess of thoseindicated, an approved
engineered design shall be used.
b. The distance specified isthe maximum distance from any vent in aparticular draft curtained areato walsor
draft curtains which form the perimeter of the draft curtained area.

SECTION 912.0 (page 191) add a new Section. Insert:

SECTION 912.0 FireHydrants

SECTION 912.1 (page 191) add a new Section. Insert:

912.1 New Subdivisions: No person shdl commence congtruction of any new building or structure
of any kindin any subdivison within the Didrict, unless such person shdl havefirs  submitted to the
Code Officid of the Mehlville Fire Protection Digtrict aplot of the aforesaid subdivison, indicating the
proposed ingdlation of the fire hydrants within such subdivison, gpproved by the Code Officid.

Page 14 of 24




SECTION 912.2 (page 191) add a new Section. Insert:

912.2 New Structures: No person shal commence congtruction of any new structure, or building,
or addition to any structure or building, within or upon any red property within the Didtrict, unless
such person shdl firgt have submitted to the Code Officia of the Didrict a plat or drawing of the
property whereon islocated such building, structure of addition, which plat or drawing hasindicated
thereon the nearest exigting fire hydrant, and if thereis not an exigting fire hydrant within such distance
as is approved by the Code Officia, then aso the proposed ingtdlation of a new fire hydrant or
hydrants, and unless, o, the particular locations proposed for such fire hydrants and the number of
fire hydrantsto be ingaled if any, shdl be gpproved by the Code Officid.

SECTION 912.3 (page 191) add anew Section. Insert:

912.3 Ingtallation of other new firehydrants: No personshdl ingal or causeto beingtdled any
fire hydrant within the Didtrict, unless the location thereof and the design and type of the hydrant,
including the threads and outlets thereof, shdl first have been approved by the Code Officidl.
SECTION 9124 (page 191) add a new Section. Insert:

912.4 Use Groups R-3 and R-4: There shal be no more than six (6) dwelling unitsconstructed
prior to the ingalation of a public water system with fire hydrants as set forth herein so as to be
accessble for Fire Didrict usein the event of afire emergency.

SECTION 912.5 (page 191) add a new Section. Insert:

912.5 Other Use Groups:. Inal other Use Groups, public water sysemswith fire hydrants shdl be
ingaled with the commencement of congtruction.

SECTION 912.6 (page 191) add a new Section. Insert:

912.6 Fire hydrant placement: Fire hydrants shal be placed within the guideines of Section
912.6.1 through 912.6.9.

SECTION 912.6.1 (page 191) add a new Section. Insert:

912.6.1 Single family resdential: In Use Groups R-3 and R-4, dngle family resdentid
developments, fire hydrant spacing shal not exceed six hundred (600) feet from hydrant to hydrant,
or asspecia gteconditionsmay dictate. Loca conditionsmay besuch that thisdistance may vary as
much as 100 feet in ether direction.

SECTION 912.6.1.1 (page 191) add a new Section. Insert:

912.6.1.1 Water supply required: InUse Groups R-3 and R-4 snglefamily developments, when

the density isone (1) dwelling unit per ten thousand (10,000) square feet of developed property or
less, and there are five (5) or more dwelling units in asingle development.

Page 15 of 24



SECTION 912.6.2 (page 191) add a new Section. Insert:

912.6.2 Multi-family residertial: In Use Group R-2, multi-family residentia developments, fire
hydrant spacing shal not exceed four hundred and fifty (450) feet from hydrant to hydrant, or as
specid steconditionsmay dictate. Loca conditionsmay be such that thisdistance may vary asmuch
as 7510 100 feet in ether direction.

SECTION 912.6.2.1 (page 191) add anew Section. Insert:

912.6.2.1 Water supply required: In Use Group R-2 multi-family resdential developments, when
there are four (4) or more dwelling units within one (1) building or structure.

SECTION 912.6.3 (page 191) add a new Section. Insert:

912.6.3 Other use group developments: In al other Use Groups, fire hydrant spacing shdl not
exceed three hundred (300) feet from hydrant to hydrant, or as specia Site conditions may dictate.
No part of a building shal be more than three hundred (300) feet from a fire hydrant. Locd
conditions may be such that the distance between fire hydrants or from a building to afire hydrant
may vary as much as 75 to 100 feet in ether direction, if otherwise gpproved by the code officid.

SECTION 912.6.4 (page 191) add a new Section. Insert:

912.6.4 Areato be provided with fire hydrants: Fire hydrants and water mains shdl be placed
aong thefull length of the property to be devel oped that abuts an existing and/or proposed improved
publicway. Variancesmay berequired by thewater agency because of water quaity considerations.

SECTION 912.6.5 (page 191) add a new Section. Insert:

912.6.5 Firehydrant spacing: Spacing of fire hydrantsaong apublic way shdl beregulated by the
Use Group classfication of the development that abuts the existing and/or proposed public way.

SECTION 912.6.6 (page 191) add a new Section. Insert:

912.6.6 Private hydrants. Where adevel opment, other than Use Group R-3 or R-4, isgreater than
one hundred fifty (150) feet from an existing and/or proposed improved public way, measured along
the drivesble access, additiond private fire hydrants shal be required on said developed property,
private streets and/or parking lots, at a spacing between fire hydrants as required by the Use Group
as st forth in Section 912.6.1 through and including Section 912.6.4.

SECTION 912.6.7 (page 191) add a new Section. Insert:
912.6.7 No parking area at fire hydrants: Wherefirehydrantsarerequired to beingtaledin aress

where vehicleswould be parked or standing, said vehicle parking or standing shdl be restricted for
ten (10) feet in each direction from the fire hydrant.

Page 16 of 24



SECTION 912.6.8 (page 191) add a new Section. Insert:

912.6.8 Unacceptable locations for fire hydrants: Fire hydrants shal not be permitted in the
locations indicated in Section 912.6.8.1.

SECTION 912.6.8.1 (page 191) add anew Section. Insert:

912.6.8.1 Prohibited locations: A fire hydrant shdl not be placed at any location where the fire
hydrant could be damaged by vehicular traffic.

SECTION 912.6.9 (page 191) add a new Section. Insert:

912.6.9 Relocation of fire hydrants. Relocation of fire hydrants requested or required by a
property owner and/or developer shall be relocated as specified by the water agency's policies and
procedures.

SECTION 912.7 (page 191) add a new Section. Insert:

912.7 Fire hydrant ingallation: All fire hydrants shdl be ingdled in accordance with Sections
912.7.1 through 912.7.3.

SECTION 912.7.1 (page 191) add a new Section. Insert:

912.7.1 Fire hydrant set back distance: All fire hydrants shal be set back from the curb or edge
of pavement. The set back shall not exceed twelve (12) feet.

SECTION 912.7.2 (page 191) add a new Section. Insert:

912.7.2 Fire hydrant connection height: Fire hydrants shal be ingdled a minimum of fourteen
(14) inches and amaximum of thirty Sx (36) inches above finished grade, measured from the center
of the steamer connection.

SECTION 912.7.3 (page 191) add a new Section. Insert:

912.7.3 Fire hydrant type: All fire hydrants shal be gpproved by the American Water Works
Asociation (AWWA) and/or Missouri American Water Company.

SECTION 912.8 (page 191) add anew Section. Insert:

912.8 Obstructions. There shal be no obstructions, plantings, bushes, trees, sgns, light slandards,
etc., within six (6) feet of any fire hydrant in dl directions.

Page 17 of 24



SECTION 912.9 (page 191) add a new Section. Insert:

912.9 Calor coding of publicfirehydrants: All publicfire hydrant barrdlsareto be painted ydlow.
All fire hydrant bonnets are to be painted as follows:

COLOR WATER MAIN SIZE

Green Twelve (12) inch and larger
Orange Eight (8) and ten (10) inch
Red Six (6) inch and smdller

SECTION 912.10 (page 191) add anew Section. Insert:

912.10 Color coding of private fire hydrants: All private fire hydrants shdl be painted yelow,
including the bonnet.

SECTION 912.11 (page 191) add anew Section. Insert:

912.11 Minimum fireflow - single hydrant: The minimum fire flow from asnglefire hydrant in
any Use Group shd| befifteen hundred (1500) galons per minute at twenty (20) ps residud pressure
unless the new hydrant is ordered on a pre-exising main.

SECTION 912.12 (page 191) add a new Section. Insert:

912.12 Minimum fireflow - next two hydrants: The minimum fire flow from the next two fire
hydrantsin any Use Group shdl be acumulative fifteen hundred (1500) galons per minute a twenty
(20) ps resdud pressure.

Exception: Detached buildings of Use Groups R-3 and R-4.
SECTION 912.13 (page 191) add anew Section. Insert:

912.13 Access. The commencement of construction of any such new subdivision, or new building,
or structure or addition by any person, within the Didtrict, shall be deemed to be the granting of
permission by such person for entry upon such property by the Missouri American Water Company,
or other water supplier, for the ingdlation of any such aforesaid fire hydrants and the water main
leading thereto, and aso to the Didtrict and to the members of its Staff and to its equipment, for
access to such fire hydrant, or hydrants, which may be located upon any such property, for any
purpose whatever within the functions of the Didtrict, in consderations of issue of building permit.

Page 18 of 24



SECTION 912.14 (page 191) add anew Section. Insert:

912.14 Building permits. The Code Officid of the Didrict shdl not gpprove, nor issue building
permits for, nor permit the congtruction of any such new subdivision, or new building or structure or
addition, so long as the owner thereof shdl fail to provide for fire hydrants, or to perform any
guarantees, or to permit access, according to this Section.

Exception: On the application of any person, the Board of Directors of the Digtrict may grant
exception to the requirements of this Section for fire hydrant ingtalations, where such person
shal proveto the satisfaction of the Board of Directorsthat thereisno water supply reasonably
availablefor the ingdlation of hydrants.

CHAPTER 10
SECTION 1009.3 Exception 5 (page 204) deletein its entirety. Insert:
1009.3 Exception 5:

5. In occupancies in Group R-3, as applicable in Section 101.2, within dwelling unitsin
occupanciesin Group R-2, asapplicablein Section 101.2, and in occupanciesin Group
U, which are accessory to an occupancy in Group R- 3, asapplicablein Section 101.2,
the maximum riser height shall be 8.25 inches and the minimum tread depth shall be 9
inches, the minimum winder tread depth a the walk line shal be 9 inches, and the
minimum winder tread depth shal be 6 inches (152 mm). A nosng not less than 0.75
inch (19.1 mm) but not more than 1.25 inches (32 mm) shal be provided on stairways
with solid risers where the tread depth islessthan 11 inches (279 mm).

SECTION 1009.3 Exception 6 (page 204) delete in its entirety.
Section 1013.2 (page 113) delete in its entirety. Insert:

1013.2 Egressthrough intervening spaces. Egressfrom aroom or space shdl not passthrough
adjoining or intervening rooms or areas, except where such adjoining rooms or areas are accessory
to the area served; are not a high-hazard occupancy; and provide a demarcated minimum 44-inch
wide aide to an exit. A maximum of one exit access shdl be permitted to pass through a kitchen,
gtoreroom, restroom, closet or smilar space provided that passage through such spaceisnot theonly
meansof accessto an exit. Anexit access shdl not passthrough aroom subject to locking. Means of
egress from dwelling units, or degping areas shdl not lead through other deeping aress, toilet rooms
or bathrooms. Means of egressare not prohibited through adjoining or intervening roomsor spacesin
a Group H occupancy when the adjoining or intervening rooms or spaces are the same or lesser
hazard occupancy group.

CHAPTER 11 (page 225 — 237) ddete dl of this Chapter exclusive of the following:

1102.0 Definitions (page 225)

Page 19 of 24



CHAPTER 12 ddetedl of this Chapter exclusve of the following:

1201 General (page 239)

1202 Definitions (page 139)

1205.4 Stairway illumination (page 240)

1205.4.1 Controls (page 241)

1205.5 Emer gency egress lighting (page 241)

1206 Yardsor Courts (page 241)

1209 Accessto Unoccupied Spaces (page 242)
CHAPTER 13 (page 243) delete this Chapter in its entirety.
CHAPTER 14

SECTION 1403.2 (page 245) delete in its entirety.

SECTION 1403.3 (page 246) delete in its entirety.

SECTION 1403.4 (page 246) delete in its entirety.

SECTION 1403.6 (page 246) delete in its entirety.

SECTION 1403.7 (page 246) ddetein its entirety.
CHAPTER 15 ddete dl Sections exclusive of the following:

1501 General: (page 253)

1502 Definitions: (page 253)

1505 Fire classification (page 254)

1507 Requirementsfor Roof Coverings (page 255)

1508 Roof insulation (page 264)

1509 Rooftop Structures (page 264)
CHAPTER 16 ddetein its entirety.
CHAPTER 17 ddete dl Sections exclusve of the following:

1701 General (page 345)

1702 Definitions (page 345)

1703 Approvals (page 345)

1704 Special Inspections (page 346)

1711 Alternative test procedure: (page 357)

CHAPTER 18 ddetein its entirety.

Page 20 of 24



CHAPTER 19 ddete dl Sections exclusive of the following:

1902 Definitions:. (page 387)
1907.7.7 Fire protection: (page 396)
1916.5 Fire-resistance rating protection: (page 403)

CHAPTER 20 ddetein its entirety.
CHAPTER 21 ddete dl Sections exclusive of the following:

2101.3.1 Fireplace drawings (page 407)

2102 Definitions (pages 407 — 410)

2103 Masonry Construction Materials (page 410 — 414)
2111 Masonry Fireplaces (pages 427 — 431)

2112 Masonry Heaters (page 431)

2113 Masonry Chimneys (pages 431 — 435)

CHAPTER 22 ddete dl Sections exclusve of the following:
2202 Definitions:. (page 437)
CHAPTER 23 ddete dl Sections exclusve of the following:

2302 Definitions (page 445)

2303.2 Fire-retardant treated wood (page 447)

2303.2.1 L abeling (pages 447 — 448)

2303.2.3 Exposur e to weather, damp or wet locations (page 448)

2303.2.4 Interior applications (page 448)

2303.2.6 Typel and |1 congtruction applications (page 448)

2304.9.5 Fastenersin preservative-treated and fir e-retar dant-tr eated wood (page 456)
2304.10 Heavy timber construction (page 456)

CHAPTER 24 ddete dl Sections exclusive of the following:

2405.4 Framing (page 523)

2406.1.2 Wired glass (page 524)

2406.4 Fire department access panels (page 526)
2407 Glassin Handrailsand Guards (page 526)

CHAPTER 25 ddete dl Sections exclusve of the following:
2503.1 General (page 529)
2502 Definitions (page 529)
2506.2 Standar ds (page 530)
2507.2 Standar ds (page 530)
Table 2508.1 (page 530)
CHAPTER 29 (PAGES 547 — 550) ddlete in its entirety.

Page 21 of 24



CHAPTER 30 ddete dl Sections exclusive of the following:

3001.2 Referenced standar ds (page 551)
3002 Hoistway Enclosures (page 551)
3003 Emer gency Operations (page 551)
3004 Hoistway Venting (page 552)
3005.2.1 Enclosure (page 552)

3005.3.1 Enclosure (page 552)

3006.1 Access (page 553)

3006.2 Venting (page 553)

3006.3 Pressurization (page 553)

3006.4 M achine rooms and machinery spaces (page 553)
3006.5 Shunt trip (page 553)

CHAPTER 31
SECTION 3107 (page 558) delete inits entirety.
SECTION 3108 (page 558) delete in its entirety.
SECTION 3109 (pages 558 — 559)

CHAPTER 32 ddete dl Sections exclusive of the following:

3202.1.3 Areaways (page 561)

3202.2 Encroachments above grade and below 8 feet in height (page 561)
3202.3 Encroachments 8 feet or mor e above grade (page 561)

3202.4 Temporary encroachments (page 561)

CHAPTER 33 ddete dl Sections exclusve of the following:

3301.2 Storage and placement (page 563)
3302.1 Remodeling and additions (page 563)
3303.3 M eans of egr ess (page 563)

3308.1.1 Obgtructions (page 565)

3309 Fire Extinguishers (page 565)

3310 Exits (page 565)

3311 Standpipes (page 565)

3312 Automatic Sprinkler Systems (page 565)

Page 22 of 24



CHAPTER 34
SECTION 3403.2 (page 567) delete in its entirety.
SECTION 3409 (pages 568 — 570) ddete in its entirety.
SECTION 3410.2 (page 320) insert October 1, 1979, as PATE TO BE INSERTED BY THE
JURISDICTION].
CHAPTER 35 (pages 579 — 596)
| CC — Internationa Exigting Building Code-2003 — delete in its entirety. (page 591)

SECTION 5. SAVINGS CLAUSE

That nothing in this Ordinance or in the Building Code hereby adopted shal be construed to affect any
suit or proceeding pending in any Court, or any rightsacquired or ligbility incurred, or any causeor causes of
action acquired or existing under any act or Ordinance hereby repeaed, as cited in Section 1; nor shdl any
just or legd right or remedy of any character be lost, impaired or affected by this Ordinance.

SECTION 6. VALIDITY.

If any Section, subsection, provision, sentence, clause or phrase of this Ordinance or of thel CC®,
International Building Code, 2003 Edition, is, for any reason, held to be uncondtitutiond or invaid, such
decison shdl not affect the vdidity of the remaining portions of this Ordinance or of said Code, and the
Mehlville Fire Protection Didrict of S. Louis County, Missouri, hereby declaresthat it would have passed the
same, even though such portions so held to uncongtitutional had not been included therein.

SECTION 7. VIOLATION, PENALTIES.

Any person, firm or corporation who shall violate any provison of thisOrdinance, or who shall fail to
comply with any of therequirementsthereof, or who shdl fail to comply with any order issued pursuant to any
Sectionthereof, shal be guilty of aClass A misdemeanor pursuant to §321.600(12) and 8557.021 R.S.Mo.
and punishable as provided by law. Each day that aviolation exists or continuesto exist shall be deemed a
Separate offense.

Page 23 of 24



SECTION 8. EFFECTIVE DATE.

This Ordinance Number _ 108  having been duly considered and voted upon by the Board of
Directors of the Mehlville Fire Protection Didtrict of St. Louis County, Missouri, was duly enacted as an
Ordinance of said Fire Protection District on the 14" day of _June , 2004. The effective date of the
Ordinance shall be at 12:01 am. onthe _1* day of _September , 2004.

Thomas P. O'Driscoll

Chairman and Director

Dave Gralike
Secretary and Director

SEAL

Daniel C. Ottoline, Sr.

Director

Page 24 of 24



