ORDINANCE NO. _109

AN ORDINANCE GOVERNING THE DESIGN, CONSTRUCTION, ALTERATION,
ENLARGEMENT, EQUIPMENT REPAIR, DEMOLITION, REMOVAL, CONVERSON, USE OR
MAINTENANCE OF ALL RESIDENTIAL BUILDINGS AND ACCESSORY STRUCTURES; AND
FURTHER PROVIDING FOR THE ISSUE IN SAID PERMITS, COLLECTION OF FEES, MAKING
OF INSPECTIONS, AND PROVIDING PENALTIES FOR THE VIOLATION THEREOF.

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS OF THE MEHLVILLE FIRE
PROTECTION DISTRICT OF ST. LOUIS COUNTY, MISSOURI AS FOLLOWS:

SECTION 1. ADOPTION OF RESIDENTIAL BUILDING CODE.

That a certain document, three (3) copies of which are on file in the office of the Code Officid of the
Mehlville Fire Protection District of St. Louis County, Missouri, being marked and designated as “ 1CC®,
International Residential Code, 2003 edition” as published by the International Code Council, Inc., together
with the standards which are referenced in Chapter 43 (pp. 507 — 523) and Appendix E (pp 549 —557) be
and is hereby adopted as the Residentid Building Code of the Mehlville Fire Protection Didrict of . Louis
County, Missouri, for the control of buildings and structures as herein provided; and each and dl of the
regulations, provisions, pendlties, conditions, and termsof the “ ICC®, Inter national Residential Code, 2003
edition” , are hereby referred to, adopted and made a part hereof, asif more fully set out in this Ordinance,
with the additions, insertions, deletions and changes prescribed in Section 4 of this Ordinance.

SECTION 2. JURISDICTIONAL TITLES.

100.1 Wherever (name of jurisdiction) appearsin such Code, it shdl read the Mehlville Fire Protection
Didtrict of S. Louis County, Missouri.

100.2 "Code Officid" wherever it may appear is defined as the Fire Marshd and/or Chief Fire

Inspector of the Mehlville Fire Protection Didtrict of . Louis County, Missouri, or his duly authorized
representative.

Page 1 of 21



SECTION 3. AMENDMENTSTOTHE INTERNATIONAL RESIDNETIAL CODE, 2003 EDITION.

CHAPTER 1
SECTION R101.1 (page 1) insert Mehlville Fire Protection Didtrict, as[NAME OF JURISDICTION].
SECTION R101.2 (page 1) delete in its entirety. Insert:

R101.2 Scope. The provisons of thelnternational Residential Code for One- and Two-Family
Dwellings shal apply to the congtruction, dteration, movement, enlargement, replacement, repair,
equipment, use and occupancy, location, remova and demoalition of detached one- and two-family
dwdlingsand multiple Sngle-family dwdlingstownhouses) not morethan threestoriesinheight witha
separate means of egress and their accessory structures. A family day care home shal be permitted
within the scope of this Code.

SECTION R102.8 (page 1) add a new section. Insert:

R102.8 Matters not provided for: Any requirements that are essentid for the structurd, fire or
sanitary safety of an existing or proposed building or structure, or for the safety of the occupants
thereof, which are not specifically provided for by this code, shal be determined by the code officidl.

SECTION R102.12 (page 3) add a new Section. Insert:

R102.12 Rule-making authority: Thecodeofficid shal have authority asnecessary intheinterest of
public hedth, safety and genera welfare, to adopt and promulgate rules and regulationsto interpret and
implement the provisons of this code to secure the intent thereof and to designate requirements
gpplicable because of loca climatic or other conditions. Such rules shal not have the effect of waiving
gructurd or fire performance requirements specificaly provided for in this code or of violating
accepted engineering practice involving public sefety.

Page 2 of 21



SECTION R105.2 (page 3) delete in its entirety, Insert:

R105.2 Work exempt from permit: Exemptionsfrom permit requirements of this code shdl not be
deemed to grant authority for any work to be donein any manner in violaion of the provisons of this
codeor any other lawsor ordinances of thisjurisdiction. Permitsshal not be required for thefollowing:

Building

1

Gas

N

One-story detached accessory structures used as tool and storage sheds,
playhouses and similar uses provided the floor area does not exceed 200 square
feet.

Portable heeting, cooking or clothes drying appliances.
Replacement of any minor part that does not dter gpprova of equipment or make
such equipment unsafe.

M echanical

A wbdpE

o U

Portable hesting appliance.

Portable ventilation equipment.

Portable cooling unit.

Steam, hot or chilled water piping within any heeating or cooling equipment
regulated by this code.

Replacement of any part which does not dter its approva or make it unsafe.
Portable evaporative cooler.

Sdf- contai ned refrigeration system containing 10 poundsor less of refrigerant and
actuated by motors of 1 horsepower or less.

SECTION R106.1 (pages 4 —5) delete in its entirety. Insert:

R106.1 Submittal documents: The congtruction documents for new congtruction, ateration,
repairs, expangon, addition or modification for buildings or structures shal be prepared by a
registered design professiona. All construction documents shall be prepared by the appropriate
registered design professional consstent with the professiona regigration laws of the State of
Missouri. The congtruction documents shdl include the name and address of the registered design
professiona and shal be signed, sedled and dated by the registered design professiond in accordance
with Section R106.1.1.

Exception:

1. Thenatureof thework applied for is such that review of congtruction documentsis not
necessary to obtain compliance with this code.

Page 3 of 21



SECTION R106.1.1 (page 5) add a new section. Insert:

R106.1.1 Application of seals. When congtruction documents are submitted, the application of
Sedls and signatures on those documents shall be required as follows:

a.  All congruction documents submitted with an gpplication for abuilding permit shall bear
an origina embossed or wet ink sed and origina signature on the front sheet of each
discipline within each set of congtruction documents; or

b. The regigtered design professond for each discipline shal place his origina sed and
ggnature upon the cover sheet of each set of construction documents.

All other sheetsof the congtruction documents, other than pecificationsor caculations, shall
bear the origina embossed, wet ink or mechanicaly reproduced sedl of the registered design
professond. Any addenda or modifications submitted for changes to the construction

documentsshal aso bear an origind seal and signature by rheregistered design professiond.
Such changes shall be clearly indicated.

Page 4 of 21



SECTION R108.2 (page 5 - 6) deeteinitsentirety. Insert:

R108.2 Schedule of permit fees: The permit feefor al work donein the Mehlville Fire Protection
Didtrict shdl be as shown in Table 108.2. The base amount shown isthe plan review fee and isnot
subject to refunds in accordance with Section R108.5.

TABLE R108.2 (page 6) add anew Table. Insert:

Permit Type Permit Fee
0001 | New Residence $50 + $1.50/1000
0002 | Residentia Addition $50 + $1.50/1000
0003 | Detached Res. Garage $50 + $1.50/1000
0004 | Fire Damage Repair $50 + $1.50/1000
0005 | Fireplace $50 + $1.50/1000
0006 | Wood Stove $50 + $1.50/1000
0007 | Residentiad Remodd $50 + $1.50/1000
0037 | Sprinkler System $100 + $3/1000
0038 | UG FireMan $100 + $3/1000
0039 | Fire Alarm System $100 + $3/1000
0051 | Miscdlaneous - Residentia $50 + $1.50/1000
0060 | Flood Damage Repair $0
0098 | Void - Resdentid $50
330 | Residentid TOP $50
335 | Residentia TOP extension $25/month

Start of construction without permit Up to $500

Reinspection fee $50

New Site Plan Review $100

Variancefiling fee $100

Demdalition permit $25 + $0.10 per 100 0. ft.

SECTION R109.1.1 (page 6) delete in its entirety. Insert:

R109.1.1 Ingpectionsrequired and inspection placard: Whenwork hasprogressed to apoint
of having windows, or when the job is an dteration or addition, the placard shall be attached to the
avalable glassin view for recording the baance of inspections required by the Resdentia Building
Code. (Failure to maintain this ingpection and identification board will not relieve the permitee of
respongbility as provided by the Residentia Building Code) Upon satisfactory completion of the
building structure, the Code Officid or hisauthorized representative will make hisfina inspection, and
if dl requirementsof the Resdentia Building Code are met, including compliance with the mechanicd,
and dectrica codes of Mehlville Fire Protection Didrict, he will remove the job ingpection card.

Page 5of 21



SECTION R109.1.2 (page 6) delete in its ertirety. Insert:

R109.1.2 I nspection sequenceand approval: Nowork shdl bedone onany part of thebuilding
or structure beyond the point indicated in each successiveingpection without first obtaining the written
approva of the Code Officid or his authorized representative. Written gpprova shdl begivenonly
after an ingpection has been made of each successve step in the congtruction and al code

requirements or corrections are completed as indicated by each of the inspectionsrequired. There
shdl be a find ingpection and gpprova of dl buildings to be completed before occupancy as
described in Section R110 of the Residentid Building Code. Failure to obtain a final inspection

before occupancy will conditute a violation of the Building Code, subject to the pendties as
described in Section R113.4. Structurd framework of any part of abuilding or structure shdl not be
covered or concedled in any manner without first obtaining the approva of the Code Officid. The
Code Officid, upon natification from the permit holder or his agent, in accordance with rules of

procedure posted in the office of the Code Officia, and described on the permit placard, shal make
the following ingpections and shal ether gpprove that section or portion of the construction as
completed, or shal notify the permit holder or his agent that he has failed to comply with the law.

SECTION R109.1.3 (page 6) delete inits entirety. Insert:

R109.1.3 Framingor rough-in inspection: A framing or rough-ininspection el bemededfter dl
framing, masonry walls, or fireplace vents and chimneys are completed, including the roof structure,
fire blocking, wdl bracing, sheething, heating and cooling duct work, or other appurtenances and
accessories which may be concedled, and after plumbing, eectricd, and fire rough-in inspections
have been posted by those ingpection departments. No mechanica, eectrica or plumbing systems
which are to be concedled shdl be covered before thisinspection has been made and approved by
the Code Officid.

SECTION R110.5 (page 7) delete inits entirety. Insert:

R110.5 Revocation: The certificate of Use and Occupancy shal aways be subject to this Code.
Non-compliance with the regulations of this Code shal be deemed aviolation subject to the pendties
st forth herein, and in addition the Code Officid shall be empowered to revoke the occupancy
permit, or permits, issued for the building in question, until such time as the violations are corrected.
All costs involved in this procedure shall be addressed againgt the owner. The issuance of any
occupancy permit shdl not relieve the owner or tenant from compliance with al regulations of this
Code and other applicable regulations.

SECTION R110.6 (page 7) add anew Section. Insert:
R110.6 Certificaterequired: Falureof theowner or tenant of abuilding to obtain the certificate of

occupancy and to pay the fees set forth shall be deemed a violation and shall subject said owner or
tenant to the penalties prescribed in Section R113.4.

Page 6 of 21



SECTION R110.6.1 (page 7) add anew Section. Insert:
R110.6.1 Feerequired: Thefeefor aCertificate of Occupancy shall beasstated in Table R108.2.
SECTION R112.1 through R112.3 (pages 7 - 8) deleteinitsentirety. Insert:

R112.1 Appeals. Anowner, lessee, agent, operator or occupant aggrieved by an order pursuant to

this order, may file an gppeal to the Board of Directors within ten (10) days from the service of any

order, and the Board of Directors shdl fix atime and place not lessthan five (5) daysor morethan

ten (10) days thereafter when and where such an appeal may be heard by it. Such apped shall stay

the execution of such order until it hasbeen heard and reviewed, vacated or confirmed by the Board.
In computing the number of days, Saturdays, Sundays and lega holidays shall be excluded.

The Board of Directors shdl, at such hearings, affirm, modify, revoke or vacate such order. In
conducting and holding the hearing, the Board of Directors shal follow the procedures set forthin
8536 RSMo. for "contested" matters. Unlessrevoked or vacated, such order shal then be complied
with.

Nothing herein contained shall be deemed to deny the right of any person, firm, corporation, co-
partnership or voluntary association to gpped from an order of adecision of the Board of Directors
to a court of competent jurisdiction. Appeds from find decisons of the Board shdl be to the
appropriate Circuit Court, pursuant to the provisons of 8536.100 RSMo. Such appeals shall stay
the execution of such order until it has been heard and reviewed, vacated or confirmed by the Court.

SECTION R113.4 (page 8) delete inits entirety. Insert:

R113.4 Violation, penalties. Any person, firm or corporation who shal violate any provision of
this Ordinance, or who shal fail to comply with any of the requirements thereof, or who shall erect,
congtruct, dter or repair astructurein violation of an approved plan or directive of the Code Officid,
or of apermit or certificate issued under the provisons of this Ordinance, or shdl start any work
requiring apermit without first obtaining apermit therefor, or who shal continue any work in or about
adructure after having been served astop-work order, except for such work which that person, firm
or corporation has been directed to perform to remove aviol ation or unsafe condition, or any owner
or tenant of a building, or premises or any other person who commits, takes part or assstsin any
violation of this Code or who maintains any building or premises in which such may causeto be
indtituted in the name of the Didtrict, acivil action for injunction or other gppropriate relief to securea
compliancewith the provisonsof thisCode. Injunctiveor other appropriate relief shal not bedenied
on the grounds that an adequate remedy a law exists through the impostion of crimina sanctions.

SECTION R113.5 (page 8) add anew section. Insert:
R113.5 Unlawful continuance: Any person who shal continue any work in or about the structure
after having been served with a stop work order, except such work as that person is directed to

perform to remove aviolation or unsafe conditions, shal beliable to pendties as specified in Section
R113.4 of this Ordinance.

Page 7 of 21



SECTION R113.6 (page 8) add a new section. Insert:
R113.6 Civil action: Notwithstanding the provisions hereof, the Code Officid, with the gpprova of
the Board of Directors, may cause to be indituted in the name of the Didtrict, a civil action for
injunction or other gppropriate relief to secure a compliance with the provisions of this Code.
Injunctive or other appropriate relief shall not be denied on the grounds that an adequate remedy at
law exigts through the imposition of crimind sanctions.
CHAPTER 2
SECTION R202.0 (pages 9 — 21) Insert:
All words and phrases and their definitions as set out in Artidle 2 of the “ ICC®, International
Residential Code,2003 Edition” , are hereby adopted by reference as though fully set out herein
with the following exceptions.
Family day care home; add a new definition as follows:
Family day care home: A family home occupied as a permanent residence by the day care
provider, inwhich family-like careis given for more than four (4) children, but not morethan ten (10)
children, not related to the day care provider, for any part of the twenty-four (24) hour day.
CHAPTER 3
SECTION R301 (pages 23 — 44) ddetein its entirety.
SECTION R303.8 (pages 45 — 46) ddetein its entirety.
SECTION R306 (page 46) delete in its entirety.
SECTION R307 (page 46) deleteinits entirety.
SECTION R308.6.3 (page 49) delete in its entirety.
SECTION R308.6.4 (page 49) delete in its entirety.
SECTION R308.6.5 (page 49) delete in its entirety.
SECTION R308.6.6 (page 49) delete in its entirety.
SECTION R308.6.7 (page 49) delete in its entirety.
SECTION R309.1 (page 49) ddletein its entirety. Insert:
R309.1 Opening pr otection. Openingsfrom aprivate garage directly into aroom used for degping
purposes shdl not be permitted. Other openings between the garage and residence shall be equipped
with solid wood doors not less than 1 3 /4 inches (44 mm) in thickness, solid or honeycomb core

gted doors not less than 1 3 /4 inches (44 mm) thick, or 20-minute fire-rated doors.

Page 8 of 21



SECTION R309.2 (page 49) delete in its entirety. Insert:

R309.2 Separ ation requir ed. Thegarage shal be separated from theresdenceanditsattic areaby
not less than 1 /2 —inch (12.7 mm) Type “X” gypsum board gpplied to the garage sde. Garages
beneath habitable rooms shdl be separated from al habitable rooms above by not lessthan 5/8-inch
(15.9mm) Type X gypsum board or equivaent. Wherethe separation isafloor-celing assambly, the
structure supporting the separation shall also be protected by not lessthan 1/2-inch (12.7 mm) Type
“X” gypsum board or equivaent.

SECTION R309.2.1 (page 49) add anew section. Insert:
R309.2.1 Joint and nail treatment. All joints shal befire taped and dl nail heads treated.
SECTION R309.3.1 (page 49) add a new section. Insert:

R309.3.1 Sill height. The slisof al door openings between private garages and adjacent interior
gpaces shdl be raised not less than 4 inches (102 mm) above the garage floor.

SECTION R309.5 (page 49) deletein its entirety.
SECTION R309.6 (page 50) deletein its entirety.
SECTION R311.4.3 (pages 50 — 51) deletein its entirety. Insert:

R311.4.3 Landings at door s. There shdl beafloor or landing on each sSde of the required egress
door.

Exception: Where a stairway of three or fewer risersis located on the exterior sde of a
door, other than the required exit door, alanding is not required for the exterior Sde of the
door.

The floor or landing at the exit door required by Section R311.4.1 shal not be more than 1.5
inches (38 mm) lower than the top of the threshold. Thefloor or landing at exterior doorsother than
the exit door required by Section R311.4.1 shall not be required to comply with this requirement but
shall have arise no greater than that permitted in Section R311.5.3.

Exception: Thelanding at an exterior doorway shal not be more than 8 “sinches (210 mm)
below the top of the threshold, provided the door, other than an exterior storm or screen
door does not swing over the landing.

The width of each landing shdl not be less than the door served. Every landing sdl havea
minimum dimension of 36 inches (914 mm) measured in the direction of trave.

SECTION R310.1.5 (page 50) add a new section. Insert:

R310.1.5 Openingsinto patio structures. Emergency escape openings shal be permitted to
open into a patio structure, provided that the patio structure shal be unenclosed.

Page 9 of 21



SECTION R311.5.3.1 (page 51) deletein its entirety. Insert:

R311.5.3.1 Riser height. Themaximum riser haght shal be 8 %4 inches (210 mm). Theriser shdll
be measured verticaly between leading edges of the adjacent treads. The grestest riser height within
any flight of stairs shdl not exceed the smdlest by more than 3 /8 inch (9.5 mm).

SECTION R311.5.3.2 (page 51) deletein its entirety. Insert:

R311.5.3.2 Tread depth. The minimum tread depth shal be 9 inches (229 mm). The tread depth
shal be measured horizontaly between the vertica planes of the foremost projection of adjacent
treads and at aright angle to the tread’ s leading edge. The greatest tread depth within any flight of
dairs shdl not exceed the smdlest by more than 3 /8 inch (9.5 mm). Winder treads shal have a
minimum tread depth of 9 inches (229 mm) messured as above at apoint 12 inches (305) mm from
the sde where the treads are narrower. Winder treads shal have aminimum tread depth of 6 inches
(152 mm) at any point. Within any flight of stairs, the greatest winder tread depth at the 12 inch (305
mm) walk line shdl not exceed the smalest by more than 3 /8 inch (9.5 mm).

SECTION R311.5.4 (page 51) delete in its entirety. Insert:

R311.5.4 Landingsfor stairways. There shdl be afloor or landing at the top and bottom of each
darway.
Exception A floor or landing isnot required a thetop of an interior or exterior flight of
gairs, provided adoor does not swing over the Sairs.

A flight of gairsshdl not have avertica rise greater than 12 feet (3658 mm) between floor
levels or landings.

Thewidth of each landing shdl not be lessthan the Sairway served. Every landing shdl have
aminimum dimension of 36 inches (914 mm) measured in the direction of travel.

SECTION R318.0 (page 56) deletein its entirety. Insert:

SECTION R318.0 Fire Hydrants

R318.1 New Subdivisions: No person shal commence congtruction of any new building or
gructure of any kind in any subdivison within the Didrict, unless such person shdl have firgt
submitted to the Code Officid of the Mehlville Fire Protection Didtrict a plot of the aforesaid

subdivision, indicating the proposed ingdlation of thefire hydrants within such subdivision, approved
by the Code Officid.

Page 10 of 21



R318.2 New Structures. No person shal commence congruction of any new structure, or
building, or addition to any structure or building, within or upon any red property within the Digtrict,
unless such person shall firgt have submitted to the Code Officid of the Didrict aplat or drawing of
the property whereon is located such building, structure of addition, which plat or drawing has
indicated thereon the nearest exigting fire hydrant, and if there is not an existing fire hydrant within
such distance as is gpproved by the Code Officid, then dso the proposed ingtallation of anew fire
hydrant or hydrants, and unless, a0, the particular | ocations proposed for such fire hydrantsand the
number of fire hydrantsto be ingtdled if any, shal be approved by the Code Officidl.

R318.3 Ingtallation of other new fire hydrants: No person shdl ingal or causeto beingaled
any fire hydrant within the Didtrict, unlessthelocation thereof and the design and type of the hydrarnt,
including the threads and outlets thereof, shall first have been approved by the Code Officid.

R318.4 Residential uses: There shdl be no more than sx (6) dwelling unitsconstructed prior to
theingalation of apublic water system with fire hydrants as set forth herein so asto be accessiblefor
Fire Didrict usein the event of afire emergency.

R318.5 Fire hydrant placement: Fire hydrants shal be placed within the guiddines of Section
R318.5.1 through R318.5.9.

R318.5.1 Detached singlefamily residential: In detached singlefamily residential developments,
fire hydrant spacing shal not exceed six hundred (600) feet from hydrant to hydrant, or asspecid Ste
conditions may dictate. Loca conditions may be such that this distance may vary as much as 100
feet in @ther direction.

R318.5.2 Attached multi-family residential: In attached multi-family resdentid devel opments; fire
hydrant spacing shal not exceed four hundred and fifty (450) feet from hydrant to hydrant, or as
gpecia site conditionsmay dictate. Local conditionsmay be such that thisdistance may vary asmuch
as 7510 100 feet in ether direction.

R318.5.2.1 Water supply required: Inattached multi-family resdentid developments, whenthere
arefour (4) or more dwelling units within one (1) building or structure.

R318.5.3 Areato be provided with fire hydrants: Fire hydrants and water mainsshal be placed
aongthefull length of the property to be devel oped that abuts an existing and/or proposed improved
publicway. Variancesmay berequired by thewater agency because of water quaity considerations.

R318.5.4 Fire hydrant spacing: Spacing of fire hydrants ong apublic way shal be regulated by
the use dassfication of the development that abuts the existing and/or proposed public way.

R318.5.5 Private hydrants: Where adevel opment, other than detached singlefamily resdences, is
greater than one hundred fifty (150) feet from an existing and/or proposed improved public way,
measured dong the driveable access, additiond private fire hydrants shdl be required on sad
developed property, private streets and/or parking lots, a a spacing between fire hydrants as
required by the Use Group as set forth in Section R318.5.1 through and including Section R318.5.4.

Page 11 of 21



R318.5.6 No parking area at fire hydrants: Wherefire hydrants are required to be ingtdled in
areaswhere vehicleswould be parked or standing, said vehicle parking or standing shal berestricted
for ten (10) feet in each direction from the fire hydrant.

R318.5.7 Unacceptable locations for fire hydrants: Fire hydrants shal not be permitted in the
locations indicated in Section R318.5.8.

R318.5.8 Prohibited locations: A fire hydrant shal not be placed a any location where the fire
hydrant could be damaged by vehicular traffic.

R318.5.9 Relocation of fire hydrants. Relocation of fire hydrants requested or required by a
property owner and/or developer shall be relocated as specified by the water agency's policies and
procedures.

R318.7 Fire hydrant ingallation: All fire hydrants shal be ingtaled in accordance with Sections
R318.7.1 through R318.7.3.

R318.7.1 Firehydrant set back distance: All firehydrantsshdl be set back from the curb or edge
of pavement. The set back shall not exceed twelve (12) feet.

R318.7.2 Fire hydrant connection height: Fire hydrantsshdl beingaled aminimum of fourteen
(14) inches and amaximum of thirty Sx (36) inches above finished grade, measured from the center
of the steamer connection.

R318.7.3 Fire hydrant type: All fire hydrants shdl be approved by the American Water Works
Association (AWWA) and/or Missouri American Water Company.

R318.8 Obstructions. Thereshdl be no obstructions, plantings, bushes, trees, Sgns, light sandards,
etc., within six (6) feet of any fire hydrant in dl directions.

R318.9 Color coding of public fire hydrants. All public fire hydrant barrels are to be painted
ydlow. All fire hydrant bonnets are to be painted as follows:

COLOR WATER MAIN SIZE

Green Twelve (12) inch and larger
Orange Eight (8) and ten (10) inch
Red Six (6) inch and smdler

R318.10 Color coding of privatefire hydrants: All privatefire hydrants shdl be painted yellow,
including the bonnet.

R318.11 Minimum fire flow - single hydrant: The minimum fire flow from a single fire hydrant

shdl befifteen hundred (1500) gallons per minute at twenty (20) ps residud pressure unlessthe new
hydrant is ordered on a pre-exising main.

Page 12 of 21



R318.12 Access. Thecommencement of congtruction of any such new subdivision, or new bulding,
or structure or addition by any person, within the Didtrict, shal be deemed to be the granting of
permission by such person for entry upon such property by the Missouri American Water Company,
or other water supplier, for the ingalation of any such aforesaid fire hydrants and the water main
leading thereto, and a0 to the Didtrict and to the members of its Staff and to its equipment, for
access to such fire hydrant, or hydrants, which may be located upon any such property, for any
purpose whatever within the functions of the Didtrict, in considerations of issue of building permit.

R318.13 Building permits. The Code Officid of the Digtrict shal not approve, nor issue building
permits for, nor permit the congtruction of any such new subdivision, or new building or Sructure or
addition, so long as the owner thereof shdl fail to provide for fire hydrants, or to perform any
guarantees, or to permit access, according to this Section.

Exception: On the gpplication of any person, the Board of Directors of the District may
grant exception to the requirements of this Section for fire hydrant ingtdlations, where such
person shdl proveto the satisfaction of the Board of Directorsthat thereis no water supply
reasonably available for the instalation of hydrants.

SECTION R319 (pages 56 - 57) ddetein its entirety.
SECTION R320 (pages 57 - 58) ddete in its entirety.
SECTION R321 (page 58) ddletein its entirety. Insert:
R321 Street Numbers

R321.1 General: Thefollowing wordsand termsshal, for the purposes of thischapter and asstated
elsawhere in this code, have the meanings shown herein.

Street address number sign: A sign which designates the street number assigned to a particular
house, building or structure,

Reoccupancy: Any changein ownership, occupancy or use of the structure which would necessitate
the issuance of a new certificate of occupancy under any other provision of this code.

R321.2 Street address number signs: Each structure required to have astreet address number
sign displayed by Section R321.3, shdl have the number so displayed in aposition easily observed
and readable from the public right-of-way. All numbers shal be in Arabic figures at least four (4)
inches high and one-hdf (Y2 ) [ original bill read 2] inch wide strokes. All such numbersshdl bea
contrasting color to the background to which they are mounted.

R321.3Ingtallation required: A street addressnumber sign conforming to Section R321.2 shal
be ingdled in the locations indicated in Sections R321.3.1 through R321.3.2.

R321.3.1 New Construction: Street address number signsshdl beingdled onal new sructures.

Street address number signs shdl be ingaled prior to the fina ingpection and issuance of the
certificate of occupancy.

Page 13 of 21



R321.3.2 Remode or renovations. Sreet address number signs shdl beingaled on existing
dructuresat any time the Structureisincreased in height or area.or when any ateration, modification
or remodeling costing more than One Thousand Dallars ($ 1,000.00) is made to such existing
dructure.

SECTION R322 (page 58) delete in its entirety

SECTION R323 (pages 58 - 60) delete in its entirety

SECTION R324 through R327 (page 60) add new Sections. Insert:

SECTION R324
GENERAL

R324.1 Scope. Fire apparatus access roads shdl be in accordance with Sections R324 through
R327.

SECTION R325
REQUIRED ACCESS

R325.1 Accessand loading. Facilities, buildingsor portions of buildings hereafter constructed shall
be accessibleto fire department apparatus by way of an approved fireagpparatus accessroad with an
asphalt, concrete or other approved driving surface capable of supporting the imposed load of fire
apparatus weighing at least 75,000 pounds (34 050 kg).

SECTION R326
MINIMUM SPECIFICATIONS

R326.1 Access road width with a hydrant. Where afire hydrant is located on afire apparatus
access road, the minimum road width shall be 26 feet (7925 mm). See Figure R326.1.

R326.2 Grade. Fire apparatus access roads shal not exceed 10 percent in grade.
Exception: Grades stegper than 10 percent as approved by the fire chief.
R326.3 Turning radius. The minimum turning radius shal be determined by the code officid.

R326.4 Dead ends. Dead-end fire gpparatus access roads in excess of 150 feet shall be provided
with width and turnaround provisions in accordance with Table R326.4.

Page 14 of 21



TABLE R326.4

REQUIREMENTS FOR DEAD-END FIRE APPARATUS ACCESS ROADS

LENGTH WIDTH TURNAROUNDS REQUIRED
(feet) (feet)
0-150 20 None required

150 —-500 20 120" Hammerhead or 60" Y 96' diameter cul-de-sac
in accordance with Figure R326.1

501 — 750 26 120' Hammerhead or 60' Y 96' diameter cul-de-sac
in accordance with Figure R326.1

Over 750 Specid approval required

L

£
SLEPTRAIT & TR AT VIHIELY Gl FANMGF
LT 8 SINF
[

s LIBUFTE
11 TF.fAr Sia- 1 HRHFNERA:

120 HaWRIES 458D FIIULNL AN A A
T i HAYRIMT-HE W

FIGURE R326.1
DEAD-END FIRE APPARATUS ACCESS ROAD TURNAROUND

R326.5 Fire apparatus access road gates. Gates securing the fire gpparatus access roads shal

comply with dl of the following criteria
1. The minimum gate width shal be 20 feet (6096 mm).
2. Gates shdl be of the swinging or diding type.
3. Construction of gates shdl be of materias that dlow manua operation by one person.

4. Gate components shal be maintained in an operative condition at al times and replaced or

repaired when defective,

5. Electric gates shal be equipped with ameans of opening the gate by fire department personnel
for emergency access. Emergency opening devices shal be approved by the code officid.

6. Manua opening gates shdl not be locked with apadlock or chain and padlock unlessthey are
capable of being opened by means of a Fire Department Master Key - Knox Box system..

7. Locking device specifications shdl be submitted for approva by the code officid.

Page 15 of 21



R326.6 Signs. When required by the code officid, fire apparatus accessroads shdl be marked with
permanent NO PARKING—FIRE L ANE sgnscomplying with Figure R326.6. Sgnsshdll havea
minimum dimension of 12 inches (305mm) wide by 18 inches (457 mm) high having red |etterson a
white reflective background. Signs shdl be posted on one or both sides of thefire apparatusroad as
required by Section R326.6.1 or R326.6.2.

SIGN TYPLC A" SIGN TYPC "G’ SIGN TYPC 'D"

NO NO NO
PARKING PARKING PARKING

FIRE LANE

—>

FIGURE R326.6
FIRE LANE SIGNS

R326.6.1 Roads 20 to 26 feet in width. Fire apparatus access roads 20 to 26 feet wide (6096 to
7925 mm) must be posted on both sdes as afire lane.

R326.6.1.2 Roads more than 26 feet in width. Fire apparatus access roads more than 26 feet
wide (7925 mm) to 32 feet wide (9754 mm) shall be posted on one side of the road as afire lane.

SECTION R327
ONE OR TWO FAMILY RESIDENTIAL DEVELOPMENTS

R327.1 One- or two-family dwelling residential developments. Developmentsof one-ortwo-
family dwdlings where the number of dwelling units exceeds 100 shal be provided with
separate and approved fire apparatus access roads, and shall meet the requirements of Section
R327.2.

Exceptions:

1. Where there are more than 100 dwdling units on a single public or private fire gpparatus
access road and dl dwelling units are equipped throughout with approved automatic
resdentia sprinkler systems in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1 or 903.3.1.3 of the
International Fire Code, access from two directions shall not be required.

2. The number of dwelling units on a single fire gpparatus access road shal not be increased
unless fire gpparatus access roads will connect with future development, as determined by
the code officid.

3. The code officid shal be permitted to increase the number of dwelling units allowed with a
singlefire apparatus access road when topography or other approved reasons do not permit
an additional access road to be provided.

R327.2 Remoteness. Where two access roads are required, they shal be placed adistance

gpart equa to not lessthan one- hdf of thelength of the maximum overdl diagond dimension
of the property or areato be served, measured in astraight line between accesses.

Page 16 of 21



CHAPTER 4 (pages 61 — 85) ddlete this entire Chapter.
CHAPTER 5 (page 87 — 110) ddlete this entire Chapter exclusive of the following:

R502.12 Draftstopping requir ed (page 96)
R502.12.1 Materials (page 96)
R502.13 Fireblocking required (page 96)

CHAPTER 6 (page 111 — 202) delete this entire Chapter exclusive of the following:

R602.8 Fireblocking required (page 120)
R602.8.1 M aterials (page 120)

R602.8.1.1 Unfaced fiber glass (page 120)
R602.8.1.2 Fireblocking integrity (page 120)

CHAPTER 7 (page 203 — 214) delete this entire Chapter exclusive of the following:

R702 Interior Covering (pages 203 - 206)
R703.5 Wood shakes and shingles (page 206)
R703.5.1 Application (page 206)

CHAPTER 8 (page 215 — 252) delete this entire Chapter exclusve of the following:

R802.1.3 Fire-retardant-treated wood (page 215)
R802.1.3.1 Labeling (page 215)

R802.1.3.2 Strength adjustments (page 215)
R802.1.3.3 Exposur e to weather (pages 215 — 216)
R802.1.3.4 Interior applications (page 216)
R803.2.1.2 Fire-retardant-treated wood (page 240)
R807 Attic Access (page 252)

R808 Insulation Clearance (page 252)

CHAPTER 9 (page 253 — 261) delete this entire Chapter exclusive of the following:
R902 Roof Classification (page 253)
R905 Requirementsfor Roof Coverings (pages 254 - 261)
R906 Roof Insulation (page 261)

CHAPTER 11 (page 273 — 287) delete this entire Chapter.

CHAPTER 15 (pages 301 — 302)

SECTION M1506 (page page 302) delete in its entirety.

Page 17 of 21



CHAPTER 16 (page 303 — 305) delete this entire Chapter exclusive of the following:
M 1601.3.3 Fireblocking (page 304)
M 1601.3.7 Ductslocated in gar ages (page 304)
M 1601.4.1 General (page 304)
M1601.4.2 M aterials (page 304)
M 1601.4.3 Fur nace connections (pages 304 — 305)
M 1601.4.4 Access (page 305)
M 1602 Return Air (page 305)
CHAPTER 19 (page 319)
SECTION M1902.4 (page 319) delete in its entirety.
CHAPTER 24 (pages 3331 — 386)
SECTION 2401.1 (page 331) delete in its entirety. Insert:
G2401.1 (101.2) Application. Thischapter coversthosefue-gas piping systems, fud- gesutilizetion
equipment and related accessories, venting systems and combugtion air configurations most
commonly encountered in the congtruction of one- and two-family dwellingsand sructuresregulated
by this code.
SECTION G2410 (page 345) delete in its entirety.
SECTION G2411 (page 345) deletein its entirety.
CHAPTER 25 (pages 387 — 388) delete this entire Chapter.
CHAPTER 26 (pages 389 — 392) delete this entire Chapter.
CHAPTER 27 (pages 393 — 397) delete this entire Chapter.
CHAPTER 29 (pages 401 - 412) ddete this entire Chapter exclusive of the following.

P2902.4.4 Connections to automatic fire sprinkler systems (page 403)
P2902.4.4.1 Additives or nonpotable sour ce (page 403)

CHAPTER 30 (pages 413 — 419) delete this entire Chapter.

CHAPTER 31 (pages 421 — 432) delete this entire Chapter.

CHAPTER 32 (page 433) delete this entire Chapter.

CHAPTER 33 (pages 435 — 439) ddete this entire Chapter exclusve of the following:

E3305 Equipment L ocation and Clear ances (pages 436 — 438)

Page 18 of 21



CHAPTER 35 (pages 445 — 453) ddete this entire Chapter exclusive of the following:

E3501.6 Service disconnect required (page 445)
E3504.1 Clearance from building openings (page 447)
E3504.2 Vertical clearances (page 448)

E3504.2.1 Aboveroofs (page 448)
E3504.2.2 Vertical clearance from grade (page 449)

CHAPTER 36 (pages 455 — 461) delete this entire Chapter.

CHAPTER 37 (pages 463 — 466) delete this entire Chapter.

CHAPTER 38 (PAGES 467 — 487) ddete this entire Chapter exclusive of the following.
E3802 Ground-Fault and Arc-Fault Circuit-Interrupter Protection (page 469)
E3807.4 Unused openings (page 484)

E3809 Flexible Cords (page 487)

CHAPTER 39 (pages 489 — 492) ddlete this entire Chapter exclusve of the following.
E3903.11 Luminairesin clothes closets (page 491)

E3904.7 Combustible low-density cellulose fiberboard (page 492)
E3904.8 Recessed luminair e clear ance (page 492)
E3904.9 Recessed luminaire installation (page 492)

CHAPTER 40 (pages 493 - 494) delete this entire Chapter.

CHAPTER 41 (pages 495 — 503) delete this entire Chapter.

CHAPTER 42 (pages 505 — 506) delete this entire Chapter.

CHAPTER 43 (pages 507 — 523)
| CC — International Existing Building Code-2003 — delete in its entirety. (page 520)

APPENDI X AE (pages 549 — 557)

SECTION AE302 (pages 550 — 551) deletein its entirety. Insert:

AE302 Application for permit. Permits shal be gpplied for in accordance with Section R105.
SECTION AE303 (page 303) delete inits entirety. Insert:

AE303 Permit issuance. Permits shal be issued in accordance with Section R105.
SECTION AE304 (page 552) delete inits entirety. Insert:

AE304 Fees. Parmit fees shal be in accordance with Table R108.2.

Page 19 of 21



SECTION AE305 (pages 552 — 553) deletein its entirety. Insert:

AD305 I nspections. Inspections shal be in accordance with Section R109.
SECTION AE305.5.1 (page 553) deletein its entirety.

SECTION AE305.5.2 (page 553) deletein its entirety.

SECTION AE305.5.3 (page 553) deletein its entirety.

SECTION AE307 (page 553) deletein its entirety.

SECTION AE307 (page 553) ddetein its entirety.

SECTION AE402 (page 553) delete inits entirety. Insert:

AE402 L ocation on Property. Manufactured homesand accessory buildingsshal belocated onthe
property in accordance with Section R302.

SECTION AES01 (page 553 — 554) ddete in its entirety.
SECTION AES02 (page 554) ddlete in its entirety.
SECTION AES03 (page 554) ddlete in its entirety.
SECTION AE504 (page 554) delete in its entirety.
SECTION AES05 (page 555) ddlete in its entirety.
SECTION AE600 (page 555) deletein its entirety.
SECTION AE601 (page 555) ddlete in its entirety.
SECTION AE6G02 (page 555) ddlete in its entirety.
SECTION AE603 (page 555) ddlete in its entirety.
SECTION AE604 (page 556) ddlete in its entirety.

SECTION AEG605 (page 557) ddetein its entirety.

Page 20 of 21



SECTION 4. SAVINGS CLAUSE

That nothing in this Ordinance or in the Residentia Building Code hereby adopted shdl be construed
to affect any suit or proceeding pending in any Court, or any rightsacquired or liability incurred, or any cause
or causes of action acquired or existing under any act or Ordinance hereby repealed, as cited in Section 1;
nor shall any just or legd right or remedy of any character be lost, impaired or affected by this Ordinance.

SECTION 5. VALIDITY.

If any Section, subsection, provision, sentence, clause or phrase of this Ordinance or of thel CC®,
International Residential Code, 2003 Edition, is, for any reason, held to be uncondtitutiond or invalid, such
decison shdl not affect the vaidity of the remaining portions of this Ordinance or of said Code, and the
Mehlville Fire Protection Didrict of S. Louis County, Missouri, hereby declaresthat it would have passed the
same, even though such portions so held to uncongtitutiona had not been included therein.

SECTION 6. VIOLATION, PENALTIES.

Any person, firm or corporation who shall violate any provison of thisOrdinance, or who shall fail to
comply with any of the requirementsthereof, or who shdl fail to comply with any order issued pursuant toany
Sectionthereof, shal be guilty of aClass A misdemeanor pursuant to §321.600(12) and 8557.021 R.S.Mo.
and punishable as provided by law. Each day that aviolation exists or continuesto exist shall be deemed a
Separate offense.

SECTION 7. EFFECTIVE DATE.

This Ordinance Number _ 109  having been duly considered and voted upon by the Board of
Directors of the Mehlville Fire Protection Didtrict of S. Louis County, Missouri, was duly enacted as an
Ordinance of said Fire Protection District on the 14" day of _June , 2004. The effective date of the
Ordinance shdl be a 12:01 am. onthe 1% day of _September , 2004.

Thomas P. O'Driscoll

Chairman and Director

Dave Gralike
Secretary and Director

SEAL

Daniel C. Ottoline, Sr.

Director

Page 21 of 21



